161121

6-22-16

30135

ORDINANCE NO.

An ordinance amending Chapter 16, “Dallas Fire Code,” of the Dallas City Code, as amended;
adopting with certain changes the 2015 Edition of the International Fire Code of the International
Code Council, Inc.; regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and
explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling, and use of hazardous substances, materials,
and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and
premises, and providing for the issuance of permits for hazardous uses or operations; providing a
penalty not to exceed $2,000; providing a saving clause; providing a severability clause; and
providing an effective date.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DALLAS:

SECTION 1. That Chapter 16, “Dallas Fire Code,” of the Dallas City Code, as amended,
is amended by adopting the 2015 Edition of the International Fire Code of the International Code
Council, Inc. (which is attached as Exhibit A and made a part of this ordinance), with the
following amendments:

1. Pages xxi-xxii, “Legislation,” are deleted.

2. Subsection 101.1, “Title,” of Section 101, “Scope and General Requirements,” of
Part 1, “General Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015
International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

“101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Dallas Fire Code [ef{NAME-OF
JURISDICTION]], hereinafter referred to as ‘this code.””

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 1



30135 161124

3. Section 101, “Scope and General Requirements,” of Part 1, “General Provisions,” of
Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is amended by
adding a new Subsection 101.6, “Exceptions,” to read as follows:

“101.6 Exceptions. For purposes of this code, the term ‘exception,” shall be defined and used
for criminal prosecution and enforcement as a defense to prosecution.”

4. Subsection 102.1, “Construction and Design Provision,” of Section 102,
“Applicability,” of Part 1, “General Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of
the 2015 International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

“102.1 Construction and design provisions. The construction and design provisions of this
code shall apply to:

1. Structures, facilities and conditions arising after the adoption of this code.

2. Existing structures, facilities and conditions not legally in existence at the time of
adoption of this code.

3. Existing structures, facilities and conditions when required in Chapter 11 or in specific
sections of this code.

4. Existing structures, facilities and conditions which, in the opinion of the fire code official,
constitute a distinct hazard to life or property.”

5. Subsection 102.4, “Application of Building Code,” of Section 102, “Applicability,”
of Part 1, “General Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015
International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:
“102.4 Application of other [building] codes. The design and construction of new structures

shall comply with this code and other codes as applicable [the-International Building-Code], and

any alterations, additions, changes in use or changes in structures required by this code, which
are within the scope of the Dallas [#nternationat] Building Code, shall be made in accordance
therewith.”

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 2



30135 161124

6. Subsection 102.7, “Referenced Codes and Standards,” of Section 102,
“Applicability,” of Part 1, “General Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of
the 2015 International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

“102.7 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referenced in this code shall
be those that are listed in Chapter 80, and such codes and standards, when specifically adopted,
shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such
reference and as further regulated in Sections 102.7.1 and 102.7.2. Whenever amendments have
been adopted to the referenced codes and standards, each reference to the codes and standards
shall be considered to reference the amendments. as well. Any reference to NFPA 70 or to the
ICC Electrical Code means the Dallas Electrical Code as adopted. References made to the
International Mechanical Code, the International Building Code, the International Plumbing
Code, the International Energy Conservation Code, the International Fuel Gas Code, the
International Existing Building Code, and the International Residential Code, respectively mean
the Dallas Mechanical Code, the Dallas Building Code, the Dallas Plumbing Code, the Dallas
Energy Conservation Code, the Dallas Fuel Gas Code, the Dallas Existing Building Code, and
the Dallas One- and Two-Family Residential Code, as amended.”

7. Paragraph 102.7.2, “Provisions in Referenced Codes and Standards,” of
Subsection 102.7, “Referenced Codes and Standards,” of Section 102, “Applicability,” of Part 1,
“General Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire
Code is amended to read as follows:

“102.7.2 Provisions in referenced codes and standards. Where the extent of the reference
to a referenced code or standard includes subject matter that is within the scope of this code

and any adopted amendments, the provisions of this code and any adopted amendments, as
applicable, shall take precedence over the provisions in the referenced code or standard.”

8. Section 103, “Department of Fire Prevention,” of Part 2, “Administrative
Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is
retitled as Section 103, “Division of Fire Prevention.”

9. Subsection 103.1, “General,” of Section 103, “Division of Fire Prevention,” of
Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015

International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 3



30135 161124

“103.1 General. The division [department] of fire prevention is established within the
jurisdiction under the direction of the fire chief [eede—offieial]. The function of the division
[department] shall be the implementation, administration and enforcement of the provisions of
this code.” ’

10. Subsection 103.2, “Appointment,” of Section 103, “Division of Fire Prevention,”
of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015
International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

“103.2 Appointment of the fire marshal. The fire chief [code—offieiad] is authorized to
designate a member of the fire department to exercise the powers and perform the duties of fire
marshal (fire code official) as set forth in this code. [shall-be-appeinted-by-the-chief-appointing
autherity-of thejurisdiction—and-t]|The fire marshal [eode—officiad] shall not be removed from

office except for cause and after full opportunity to be heard on specific and relevant charges by
and before the appointing authority.”

11. Section 103, “Division of Fire Prevention,” of Part 2, “Administrative
Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is
amended by adding a new Subsection 103.5, “Fire Prevention Division Personnel and Police,” to
read as follows:

“103.5 Fire prevention division personnel and police. The fire chief and members of the fire
prevention division have the powers of a police officer in performing their duties under this code.

When requested to do so by the fire chief, the chief of police is authorized to assign available
police officers as necessary to assist the fire department in enforcing the provisions of this code.”

12. Subsection 104.1, “General,” of Section 104, “General Authority and
Responsibilities,” of  Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and
Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

“104.1 General. The fire chief [eode-officiad] is hereby authorized to enforce the provisions of
this code and shall have the authority to render interpretations of this code, and to adopt policies,
procedures, rules and regulations in order to clarify the application of its provisions. Such
interpretations, policies, procedures, rules and regulations shall be in compliance with the intent
and purpose of this code and shall not have the effect of waiving requirements specifically
provided for in this code. Under the fire chief’s direction, the fire department is authorized to
enforce all state laws, city ordinances and executive orders of the jurisdiction.

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 4



30135 161124

104.1.1 Stopping uses, evacuation. The fire chief is authorized to order an operation or use
stopped or the evacuation of any premises, building or portion thereof which does not have a
valid certificate of occupancy in accordance with Section 102.3 and Section 114.”

13. Subsection 104.2, “Applications and Permits,” of Section 104, “General Authority
and Responsibilities,” of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and
Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

“104.2 Applications and permits. The fire chief [code—officiat] is authorized to receive
applications, review construction documents [and-issue-permitsforconstraction-regulated-by-this

eode], issue permits for operations regulated by this code, inspect the premises for which such
permits have been issued and enforce compliance with the provisions of this code.”

14. Paragraph 104.6.1, “Approvals,” of Subsection 104.6, “Official Records,” of
Section 104, “General Authority and Responsibilities,” of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,”
of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is amended to
read as follows:

“104.6.1 Approvals. A record of approvals and equivalent or alternative methods granted

shall be maintained by the fire chief [eode—officiat] and shall be available for public
inspection during business hours in accordance with applicable laws.”

15. Subsection 104.10, “Fire Investigations,” of Section 104, “General Authority and
Responsibilities,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code
is amended to read as follows:

“104.10 Fire investigations. The [fire-code—official—the] fire department is authorized [er
otherresponsible-autherity-shall- have-the-autherity] to promptly investigate the cause, origin and

circumstances of each and every [an¥] fire occurring in the jurisdiction involving loss of life,

injury to a person, or destruction or damage to property [;explesion—or—other—hazardous

eondition]. Information that could be related to trade secrets or processes shall not be made part
of the public record except as directed by a court of law.”

16. Subsection 104.11, “Authority at Fires and Other Emergencies,” of Section 104,
“General Authority and Responsibilities,” of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1,

“Scope and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 5



30135 161124

“104.11 Authority at fires and other emergencies. The fire chief or officer of the fire
department in charge at the scene of a fire or other emergency involving the protection of life or
property or any part thereof, shall have the authority to direct such operation as necessary to
extinguish or control any fire, perform any rescue operation, investigate the existence of
suspected or reported fires, gas leaks or other hazardous conditions or situations, or take any
other action necessary in the reasonable performance of duty. The fire chief is authorized to
investigate the cause, origin and circumstances of unauthorized releases of hazardous materials.
In the exercise of such power, the fire chief is authorized to prohibit any person, vehicle, vessel
or thing from approaching the scene and is authorized to remove, or cause to be removed or kept
away from the scene, any vehicle, vessel or thing which could impede or interfere with the
operations of the fire department and, in the judgment of the fire chief, any person not actually
and usefully employed in the extinguishing of such fire or in the preservation of property in the
vicinity thereof.”

17. Section 104, “General Authority and Responsibilities,” of Part 2, “Administrative
Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is
amended by adding a new Subsection 104.12, “Procedure,” to read as follows:

“104.12 Procedure. The following procedures apply to fire investigations:

104.12.1 Written report. The fire chief shall make a written report of the facts developed
by the investigation, including the cause, origin and circumstances of the fire; the extent of
property damage or personal injury; the amount of fire insurance carried on the property; the
name and address of the carrier; and any other information relevant to the fire.

104.12.2 Insurance information. At the request of the fire chief, the carrier or its agent
shall immediately furnish information regarding the amount of fire insurance carried on the
property, the carrier’s name and address and any other information relevant to the fire.

104.12.3 Inspections. The fire chief may enter and inspect any building or premises where a
fire has occurred or which has been jeopardized by an adjoining fire. The inspection shall be
conducted in a reasonable manner as soon after the occurrence of the fire as possible. No
person may refuse admittance to the fire chief if the fire chief is identified by a uniform or
through exhibition of credentials.

104.12.4 Hearings. The fire chief may conduct public or private hearings to aid in an
investigation. Hearing process may be served by an officer designated by the fire chief. The
fire chief may summon witnesses, require production of written documents, administer oaths
and affirmations to witnesses, take or cause to be taken the sworn testimony of witnesses,
and prohibit witnesses from communicating with one another until they have been examined.
No person summoned may refuse to appear, to produce written documents, or to be sworn.

104.12.5 Prosecution. After investigation, if the fire chief believes there is sufficient
evidence to charge a person with a crime committed in connection with the fire, the fire chief

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 6



10135 161127

shall arrest or cause the person to be arrested and charged. The fire chief shall furnish to the
prosecuting attorney all available evidence, including the names of witnesses and a transcript
of testimony taken at the hearing.”

18. Section 105, “Permits,” of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1,
“Scope and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is retitled as Section 105,
“Permits and Fees.”

19. Paragraph 105.1.2, “Types of Permits,” of Subsection 105.1, “General,” of
Section 105, “Permits and Fees,” of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope
and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is deleted.

20. Paragraph 105.1.6, “Annual Permit,” of Subsection 105.1, “General,” of Section
105, “Permits and Fees,” of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and
Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is deleted.

21.  Paragraph 105.2.2, “Inspection Authorized,” of Subsection 105.2, “Application,”
of Section 105, “Permits and Fees,” of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope
and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

“105.2.2 Inspection authorized. Before a [new—operational] permit is approved, the fire
chief [eode—officiat] is authorized to and shall inspect the receptacles, vehicles, buildings,

devices, limited access gates, premises, storage spaces or areas to be used to determine
compliance with this code or any operational constraints required.”

22. Paragraph 105.2.3, “Time Limitation of Application,” of Subsection 105.2,
“Application,” of Section 105, “Permits and Fees,” of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of
Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is deleted.

23.  Paragraph 105.2.4, “Action on Application,” of Subsection 105.2, “Application,”
of Section 1035, “Permits and Fees,” of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope

and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 7



30135 161124

“105.2.4 Action on application. The fire code official shall examine or cause to be examined
applications for permits and amendments thereto within a reasonable time after filing. If the
application or the construction documents do not conform to the requirements of pertinent
laws, the fire chief [eede-effieial] shall reject such application in writing, stating the reasons
therefor. If the fire code official is satisfied that the proposed work or operation conforms to
the requirements of this code and laws and ordinances applicable thereto, the fire code
official shall issue a permit therefor as soon as practicable.”

24. Subsection 105.3, “Conditions of a Permit,” of Section 105, “Permits and Fees,”
of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015
International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

“105.3 Conditions of a permit. A permit shall constitute permission to maintain, store or
handle matenals or to conduct processes which produce COl’ldlthIlS hazardous to life or

er—medﬁ—}ea&eﬂ] in accordance with the prov151ons of this codc whcrc a permit is rcqu1red by
Section 105.6 or 105.7. Such permission shall not be construed as authority to violate, cancel or
set aside any of the provisions of this code or other applicable regulations or laws of the
jurisdiction.”

25.  Paragraph 105.3.1, “Expiration,” of Subsection 105.3, “Conditions of a Permit,”
of Section 105, “Permits and Fees,” of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope

and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

“105.3.1 Expiration. A[r-eperational] permit shall remain in effect until reissued, renewed,
or rcvokcd or for such a penod of time as spcmﬁcd in the permlt [@eﬂs&ueﬁeﬂ—pefmﬁs—shaﬂ

are not transfcrable and any changc in occupancy, operation, tenancy or owncrshlp shall
require that a new permit be issued.”

26.  Paragraph 105.3.3, “Occupancy Prohibited before Approval,” of Subsection

105.3, “Conditions of a Permit,” of Section 105, “Permits and Fees,” of Part 2, “Administrative

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 8



30135 161124

Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is
amended as to read as follows:
“105.3.3 Occupancy prohibited before approval. The building or structure shall not be

occupied prior to the fire code official issuing a permit, when required, and conducting
associated inspections indicating the applicable provisions of this code have been met.”

27. Paragraph 105.3.4, “Conditional Permits,” of Subsection 105.3, “Conditions of a
Permit,” of Section 105, “Permits and Fees,” of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter
1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is deleted.

28.  Paragraph 105.3.6, “Compliance with Code,” of Subsection 105.3, “Conditions of
a Permit,” of Section 105, “Permits and Fees,” of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter
1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is amended to read as
follows:

“105.3.6 Compliance with code. The issuance or granting of a permit shall not be construed
to be a permit for, or an approval of, any violation of any of the provisions of this code or of

any other ordinance of the jurisdiction. Permits presuming to give authority to violate or
cancel the provisions of this code or other ordinances of the jurisdiction shall not be valid.

i a¥atinn a e on ar O d o 13 0 a AN d o - - ava) Nravon
O v unn v wie v an v G 7 > 7 ct

29. Subsection 105.6, “Required Operational Permits,” of Section 105, “Permits and

Fees,” of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the
2015 International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

“105.6 Required [operational] permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
[eperatienal] permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.52[47].

105.6.1 Aerosol products. A[s—eperational] permit is required to manufacture, store or
handle an aggregate quantity of Level 2 or Level 3 aerosol products in excess of 500 pounds
(227 kg) net weight.

105.6.2 Amusement buildings. A[a—eperatienal] permit is required to operate a special
amusement building.

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 9



135 161124

¢ j“j_’j

20

105.6.3 Aviation facilities. A[r-operational] permit is required to use a Group H or Group S
occupancy for aircraft servicing or repair and aircraft fuel-servicing vehicles. Additional
permits required by other sections of this code include, but are not limited to, hot work,
hazardous materials and flammable or combustible finishes.

105.6.4 Carbon Dioxide systems used in beverage dispensing applications. A[a
operational] permit is required for carbon dioxide systems used in beverage dispensing
applications having more than 100 pounds of carbon dioxide.

105.6.5 Carnivals and fairs. A[a-eperational] permit is required to conduct a carnival or
fair.

105.6.6_Asphalt (tar) kettles. A permit is required for the operation of an asphalt (tar)
kettle. A separate permit is required for each location where these activities are being
conducted. Additional permits required by other sections of this code include, but are not

limited to, hot work and LP- -gas. [Geﬂt*asﬂﬂtfate—ﬁhn—ﬁr&epefa&eﬂa}pefmﬁ—}s%meﬁe

105.6.8 Combustible fibers. A[a-operational] permit is required for the storage and handling
of combustible fibers in quantities greater than 100 cubic feet (2.8 m>).

Exception: A permit is not required for agricultural storage.

105.6.9 Compressed gases. A[s—operational] permit is required for the storage, use or
handling at normal temperature and pressure (NTP) of compressed gases in excess of the
amounts listed in Table 105.6.8.

Exception: Vehicles equipped for and using compressed gas as a fuel for propelling the
vehicle.

TABLE 105.6.9
PERMIT AMOUNTS FOR COMPRESSED GASES

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 10



30135 161124

AMOUNT
TYPE OF GAS (cubic feet at NTP)
Corrosive 200

Flammable (except cryogenic fluids and | 200
liquefied petroleum gases)

Highly toxic Any Amount
Inert and simple asphyxiant 6,000
Oxidizing (including oxygen) 504
Pyrophoric Any Amount
Toxic Any Amount

For SI: 1 cubic foot = 0.02832 m.
a. For carbon dioxide used in beverage dispensing applications, see Section 105.6.4.

105.6.11 Cryogenic fluids. A[r-operational] permit is required to produce, store, transport
on site, use, handle or dispense cryogenic fluids in excess of the amounts listed in Table
105.6.10.

Exception: Permits are not required for vehicles equipped for and using cryogenic fluids
as a fuel for propelling the vehicle or for refrigerating the lading.

TABLE 105.6.10
PERMIT AMOUNTS FOR CRYOGENIC FLUIDS

INSIDE BUILDING | OUTSIDE BUILDING
TYPE OF CRYOGENIC FLUID | (gallons) (gallons)
Flammable More than 1 60
Inert 60 500
Oxidizing (includes oxygen) 10 50
Physical or health hazard not | Any Amount Any Amount
indicated above

For SI: 1 gallon=3.785L.]

105.6.12 Cutting and welding. A[n-operatienal] permit is required to conduct cutting or
welding operations within the jurisdiction.

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 11



30135 161124

105.6.13 Dry cleaning. A[a-eperatienal] permit is required to engage in the business of dry
cleaning or to change to a more hazardous cleaning solvent used in existing dry cleaning
equipment.

105.6.14 Exhibits and trade shows. A[n-eperational] permit is required to operate exhibits
and trade shows.

105.6.15 Explosives. A[r-operational] permit is required for the manufacture, transportation,
storage, handling, sale or use of any quantity of explosive , explosive material, fireworks, or
pyrotechnic special effects within the scope of Chapter 56.

Exception: Storage in Group R-3 occupancies of smokeless propellant, black powder and
small arms primers for personal use, not for resale and in accordance with Section 5606.

105.6.16 Reserved. [Ei

s
-

105.6.17 Flammable and combustible liquids. A[a-eperational] permit is required:

1. To use or operate a pipeline for the transportation within facilities of flammable or
combustible liquids. This requirement shall not apply to the off-site transportation in
pipelines regulated by the Department of Transportation (DOTn) nor does it apply to
piping systems.

2. To store, handle or use Class Iliquids in excess of 5 gallons (19 L) in a building or in
excess of 10 gallons (37.9 L) outside of a building, except that a permit is not
required for the following:

2.1.  The storage or use of Class I liquids in the fuel tank of a motor vehicle,
aircraft, motorboat, mobile power plant or mobile heating plant, unless such
storage, in the opinion of the fire code official, would cause an unsafe
condition.

2.2.  The storage or use of paints, oils, varnishes or similar flammable mixtures
when such liquids are stored for maintenance, painting or similar purposes for
a period of not more than 30 days.

3. To store, handle or use Class II or Class IIIA liquids in excess of 25 gallons (95 L) in

a building or in excess of 60 gallons (227 L) outside a building, except for fuel oil
used in connection with oil-burning equipment.

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 12



30135 161124

4. To store, handle or use Class IIIB liquids in tanks or portable tanks for fueling motor
vehicles at motor fuel-dispensing facilities or where connected to fuel-burning
equipment.

Exception: Fuel oil and used motor oil used for space heating or water heating.

5. To remove Class I or II liquids from an underground storage tank used for fueling
motor vehicles by any means other than the approved, stationary on-site pumps
normally used for dispensing purposes.

6. To operate tank vehicles, equipment, tanks, plants, terminals, wells, fuel-dispensing
stations, refineries, distilleries and similar facilities where flammable and combustible
liquids are produced, processed, transported, stored, dispensed or used. This includes
tanks, lines, monitor wells and other appurtenances of the tank system.

7. To remove, abandon, or place temporarily out of service (for more than 90 days) an
underground, protected above-ground or above-ground flammable or combustible
liquid tank. This includes tanks, lines, monitor wells, and other appurtenances of the

tank system.

8. To change the type of contents stored in a flammable or combustible liquid tank to a
material that poses a greater hazard than that for which the tank was designed and
constructed.

9. To manufacture, process, blend or refine flammable or combustible liquids.
10. To install, construct, or alter tank vehicles, equipment, tanks, plants, terminals, wells,

fuel-dispensing stations, refineries, distilleries, and similar facilities where flammable
and combustible liquids are produced, processed, transported, stored, dispensed, or

aV-Na a¥atal a¥Wn AWa - a a ¥ a a¥= - r ) aavaldal

11. To store, handle or use Class III liquids in tanks or portable tanks for fueling motor
vehicles and construction equipment at construction sites. [Feo—atiize—a-sitefor-the

105.6.18 Floor or wall finishing. A[a—eperatienal] permit is required for floor or wall
finishing or surfacing operations exceeding 350 square feet (33 m?) using Class I or Class II
liquids.

105.6.19 Fruit and crop ripening. A[s-eperational] permit is required to operate a fruit-, or
crop-ripening facility or conduct a fruit-ripening process using ethylene gas.

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 13



30135 161124

105. 6 20 Reserved.

105.6.21 Hazardous materials. A[a-eperatienal] permit is required to store, transport on
site, dispense, use or handle hazardous materials in excess of the amounts listed in Table
105.6.21.

105.6.22 HPM facilities. A[n—eperational] permit is required to store, handle or use
hazardous production materials.

[Table 105.6.21 is adopted with no amendments. ]

105.6.23 High-piled storage. A[s—operational] permit is required to use a building or
portion thereof as a high-piled storage area exceeding 500 square feet (46 m?).

105.6.24 Hot work operations. A[a-eperational] permit is required for hot work including,
but not limited to:

1. Public exhibitions and demonstrations where hot work is conducted.

2. Use of portable hot work equipment at construction sites or inside a structure.
E ons Wosk that 1 ] . ]

3. Fixed-site hot work equipment such as welding booths.

4. Hot work conducted within a [wildfire] hazardous fire area.

5. Application of roof coverings with the use of an open-flame device.

6. Mobile Welding/Cutting (Hot Works) apparatus. A separate permit is required for

each mobile W/C (hot work) vehicle. [Wheﬂ—appwveé—ﬁae—ﬁ#e—eede—aﬁiaal—shau

6.1. The fire department shall inspect each vehicle to ensure the equipment is in

good working order and in compliance with the provisions of Chapter 35 before
issuing a permit to operate.

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 14



30135 161124

6.2. Regulations will be given to the owner/operator of the apparatus. The
responsible person shall sign a form statine he has received a copy of the

regulations.

6.3. The owner/operator of the apparatus shall ensure compliance with the
requirements found in the regulations received.

6.4. A separate permit is required for each separate activity and location where
these activities are being conducted.

105.6.25 Industrial ovens. A[n-eperational] permit is required for operation of industrial
ovens regulated by Chapter 30.

105.6.26 Lumber yards and woodworking plants. A[s-eperational] permit is required for
the storage or processing of lumber exceeding 100,000 board feet (8,333 ft*) (236m”>).

105.6.27 Liquid or-gas-fueled vehicles or equipment in assembly buildings. Alzn
operational] permit is required to display, operate or demonstrate liquid-or gas-fueled
vehicles or equipment in assembly buildings.

105.6.28 LP-gas. A[n-eperatienal] permit is required for:

1. Storage and use of LP-gas where the aggregate capacity of containers is more than
100 gallons (379 L) in water capacity.

2. The use of [Operation-of-cargo-tankers-that-transpert] LP-gas for demonstration or

portable cooking equipment. See Chapter 61.

105.6.29 Magnesium. A[n-operational] permit is required to melt, cast, heat treat or grind
more than 10 pounds (4.54 kg) of magnesium.

105.6.30 Miscellaneous combustible storage. A[r-operational] permit is required to store
in any building or upon any premises in excess of 2,500 cubic feet (71 m®) gross volume of
combustible empty packing cases, boxes, barrels or similar containers, rubber tires, rubber,
cork or similar combustible material.

105.6.31 Reserved. [Meotorfuel-dispensinefacilities-An-opera

105.6.32 Open burning. Al[s-eperational] permit is required for the kindling or maintaining
of an open fire, recreational fire or a fire on any public street, alley, road, or other public or
private ground. Instructions and stipulations of the permit shall be adhered to.

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 15



30135 ?5ii2%
[Exeeption:Recreational fires-|

105.6.32.1 Trench burning. A separate permit is required for each day of trench
burning.

105.6.32.2 Air curtain incinerators/pit burners. A separate permit is required to
operate an air curtain incinerator/pit burner or similar type device that uses an air curtain
to burn waste.

105.6.33 Open flames and torches. A[n-eperational] permit is required to remove paint
with a torch; or to use a torch or open-flame device in a [wildfirerisk] fire area.

105.6.34 Open flames and candles. A[s-eperational] permit is required to use open flames
or candles in connection with assembly areas, dining areas of restaurants or drinking
establishments. This permit includes the use of free-standing IP-gas heaters in assembly

occupancies.

105. 6 35 Reserved [ o4

105.6.36 Reserved. [Pla
placeof-assenbiy]

105.6.37 Private fire hydrants and water supplies. An annual [eperatienal] permit is

required for the [removal-frem-—serviee;] use or operation of private fire hydrants or alternate
water supplies.

-],

105.6.38 Pyrotechnic special effects material. A[n—operational] permit is required for
transportation, use, [ard] handling, storage and display of pyrotechnic special effects
material. See Chapter 56.

105.6.39 Reserved. [Pyrexylin-plasties—An-operational-permit-isrequiredforstorage-or

105.6.40 Refrigeration equipment. An annual [eperational] permit is required to operate a
mechanical refrigeration unit or system regulated by Chapter 6.

105.6.41 Reserved. [Repa rel-di
p%%ﬁ%dﬁ%@ﬁaﬁen—aﬁ%ﬁwgamgﬁ—]

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 16



105.6.42 Reserved. [Roe
of-arooftop-heliport]

105.6.43 Spraying or dipping. A[s-operational] permit is required to conduct a spraying or
dipping operation utilizing flammable or combustible liquids or the application of
combustible powders regulated by Chapter 24.

105.6.44 Storage of scrap tires and tire byproducts. A[n-oeperational] permit is required to
establish, conduct or maintain storage of scrap tires and tire byproducts that exceeds 2,500
cubic feet (71 m3) of total volume of scrap tires, and for indoor storage of tires and tire
byproducts.

105.6.45 Temporary membrane structures, tents and canopies. A[n-operational] permit
is required to operate an air-supported temporary membrane structure[;—a—temperary-stage
eanepy] or a tent having an area in excess of 399 [400] square feet (37 m2) Or a canopy in
excess of 399 [400] square feet (37 m?).

Exceptions:

1. Tents used exclusively for recreational camping purposes.

2. Fabric canopies [tents] open on all sides which comply with all of the following:

2.1 Inglividual canopies [teats] having a maximum size of 700 square feet (65
m).

2.2.  The aggregate area of multiple canopies [tents] placed side by side without
a fire break clearance of not less than 12 feet (3658 mm) shall not exceed

700 square feet (65 m?) total.

2.3. A minimum clearance of 12 feet (3658 mm) to structures and other tents
shall be provided.

3. Awnings.

4. Tents having an occupant load of less than 10 persons.

105.6.46 Tire-rebuilding plants. A[s-eperational] permit is required for the operation and
maintenance of a tire rebuilding plant.

105.6.47 Waste handling. Al[a-operatienal] permit is required for the operation of wrecking
yards, junk yards and waste material-handling facilities.

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 17



30135 161124

105.6.48 Acetylene generator. A permit is required to operate an acetylene generator. See

Chapter 35. [Wood-produets—An—operationalpermit—is—required—to—store—chips—hogged
- . . 2

materiatlwnber-or-plywoodinexcessof-200-cunbicfeet {61 ]

105.6.49 Commercial cooking fire-extinguishing system. A permit is required to install an
approved automatic fire-extinguishing system for commercial cooking systems.

105.6.50 Calcium carbide storage. A permit is required to store more than 200 pounds of
calcium carbide. See Chapter 35.

105.6.51 Limited access gates. An annual permit is required for the operation of limited
access gates which obstruct fire apparatus access roads and which open electro-mechanically,
using an approved Dallas Fire-Rescue Department radio receiver and transmitter,

105.6.52 Mobile fueling. A separate permit is required for each mobile refueling apparatus
utilized for the purpose of transferring fuel in accordance with this section. A separate
permit is required for each site where mobile refueling operations take place in accordance
with this section. See Chapter 57.

105.6.53 State licensed facilities. An annual permit is required to operate a child care
facility, adult day care facility, small assisted living facility, or a residential care facility as
defined by the Texas Department of Aging and Disability Services and the Texas Department
of Family and Protective Services.”

30. Paragraph 105.7.4, “Cryogenic Fluids,” of Subsection 105.7, “Required
Construction Permits,” of Section 105, “Permits and Fees,” of Part 2, “Administrative
Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015 International Fire Code is

amended to read as follows:

“[FA4]105.7.4 Reserved. [Cryogeniefluids—A-construction-permit-isrequiredfor-installation

31. Paragraph 105.7.14, “Smoke Control or Smoke Exhaust Systems.” of Subsection

105.7, “Required Construction Permits,” of Section 105, “Permits and Fees,” of Part 2,
“Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015

International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 18



30135 161'124

32.  Paragraph 105.7.18, “Temporary Membrane Structures and Tents,” of Subsection

105.7, “Required Construction Permits,” of Section 105, “Permits and Fees,” of Part 2,
“Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the 2015
International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

“105.7.18 Temporary membrane structures, [and] tents and canopies. A construction
permit is required to erect an air-supported temporary membrane structure[;—a—temperacy
stage—canepy] or a tent having an area in excess of 399 [400] square feet (37 m?). Tents
and/or other membrane structures shall not be erected on the top/roof of an existing structure
without first providing acceptable documentation of the structural integrity of the existing
building to support the anticipated live and static loads to the fire code official.

Exceptions:

1. Tents used exclusively for recreational camping purposes.

2. Funeral tents and curtains, or extensions attached thereto, when used for funeral
services.

3. Tents, fabric canopies, and awnings open on all sides which comply with all of
the following:

3.1.  Individual canopies shall have a maximum size of 700 square feet (65 m?).
3.2.  The aggregate area of multiple canopies [tents] placed side by side without
a fire break clearance of not less than 12 feet (3658 mm) shall not exceed

700 square feet (65 m2) total.

3.3. A minimum clearance of 12 feet (3658 mm) to structures and other tents
shall be maintained.

4. Tents having an occupant load of less than 10 persons.”

33. Subsection 105.7, “Required Construction Permits,” of Section 105, “Permits and

Fees,” of Part 2, “Administrative Provisions,” of Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration,” of the

Amend Chapter 16 (adopt 2015 International Fire Code) — Page 19






